

**Lakewood Board of Education
Lakewood, New Jersey**

ADDITIONS TO THE BODY OF THE AGENDA

January 27, 2021

**X. REPORTS AND RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE BUSINESS
ADMINISTRATOR/BOARD SECRETARY:**

D2. Approval of Supplemental Bills List for the Warrant Account for January 27, 2021 in the amount of \$4,711,009.80.

G2. Approval of Payroll and Board Share of Fica/Medi and DCRP for:

- January 30, 2021 in the amount of \$2,726,264.56

I Transportation Items:

5. Approve changes to the following route amounts for multi contract number 1916 with Seman Tov, Inc. as follows per the County Superintendent's Office calculation discrepancies.

SCHWC12 change from \$228.83 per diem to \$228.40 per diem for 244 days total equals to \$55,729.60

SCHWC14P change from \$218.66 per diem to \$218.23 per diem for 144 days total equals to \$31,425.12

SCHWC17P change from \$203.40 per diem to \$202.98 per diem for 144 days total equals to \$29,229.12

OWSWC19P change from \$142.38 per diem to 142.04 per diem for 144 days total equals to \$20,453.76

6. Move to approve the corrections to the award of Bid T02-2021 for ESY Student Transportation originally awarded on 6/29/2020 and 7/15/2020 as follows: The awards to Hartnett and DAG have been amended. CENT2P is awarded to Hartnett and CENT3P is awarded to D.A.G.

Eight (8) Bids were received and are recorded as follows:

VENDOR: SCHOOLBOUND					VENDOR: KLARR				
ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS	INC/DEC	ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS AIDE	INC/DEC
			AIDE						
LHS1S*	\$	\$		\$	LHS1S*	\$124.00	\$44.00	\$168.00	\$0.01
LMS1S*	\$	\$		\$	LMS1S*	\$122.00	\$42.00	\$164.00	\$0.01
LMS2S*	\$	\$		\$	LMS2S*	\$122.00	\$42.00	\$164.00	\$0.01
LMS3S*	\$	\$		\$	LMS3S*	\$122.00	\$42.00	\$164.00	\$0.01
LHS2S*	\$	\$		\$	LHS2S*	\$125.00	\$44.00	\$169.00	\$0.01
OAK8S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK8S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
LECC4S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC4S*	\$164.00	\$42.00	\$206.00	\$0.01
LECC1S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC1S*	\$124.00	\$42.00	\$166.00	\$0.01
LECC2S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC2S*	\$164.00	\$34.00	\$198.00	\$0.01
LECC3S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC3S*	\$164.00	\$42.00	\$206.00	\$0.01
OAK5S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK5S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
OAK6S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK6S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
HOMEOAK*	\$175.56	\$26.18	\$201.74	\$0.01	HOMEOAK*	\$174.00	\$44.00	\$218.00	\$0.01
OAK7S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK7S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
OAK1S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK1S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
OAK2S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK2S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
OAK3S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK3S*	\$164.00	\$40.00	\$204.00	\$0.01
OAK4S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK4S*	\$150.00	\$42.00	\$192.00	\$0.01
SCHI1P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI1P*	\$164.00	\$44.00	\$208.00	\$0.01
SCHI2P*	\$	\$	\$	\$	SCHI2P*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI3P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI3P*	\$188.00	\$44.00	\$232.00	\$0.01
SCHI4P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI4P*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
CENT2P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT2P*	\$184.00	\$44.00	\$228.00	\$0.01
CENT3P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT3P*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
CENT4P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT4P*		\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI8P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI8P*	\$225.00	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$0.01
SCHI10P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI10P*	\$225.00	\$45.00	\$270.00	\$0.01
SCHI11P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI11P*	\$225.00	\$44.00	\$269.00	\$0.01
CENT1P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT1P*	\$180.00	\$44.00	\$224.00	\$0.01
SCHI12P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI12P*	\$188.00	\$44.00	\$232.00	\$0.01
SCHI13P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI13P*	\$188.00	\$44.00	\$232.00	\$0.01
SCHI14P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI14P*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI15P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI15P*		\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI16P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI16P*		\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI17P*	\$170.00	\$19.64	\$189.64	\$0.01	SCHI17P*	\$225.00	\$34.00	\$259.00	\$0.01
SCHI9P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI9P*	\$164.00	\$44.00	\$208.00	\$0.01
SCHI5P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI5P*	\$164.00	\$34.00	\$198.00	\$0.01
SCHI6P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI6P*	\$188.00	\$34.00	\$222.00	\$0.01
SCHI7P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI7P*	\$250.00	\$34.00	\$284.00	\$0.01
CENT7P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT7P*	\$108.00	\$28.00	\$136.00	\$0.01
CENT5P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT5P*	\$110.00	\$32.00	\$142.00	\$0.01
CENT6P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT6P*	\$110.00	\$32.00	\$142.00	\$0.01
LHSSP3*	\$155.00	\$26.18	\$181.18	\$0.01	LHSSP3*	\$124.00	\$34.00	\$158.00	\$0.01
LMSSP5*	\$	\$		\$	LMSSP5*	\$134.00	\$42.00	\$176.00	\$0.01

LMSSP4*	\$	\$		\$	LMSSP4*	\$122.00	\$42.00	\$164.00	\$0.01
LHSSP4*	\$	\$		\$	LHSSP4*	\$125.00	\$34.00	\$159.00	\$0.01
OAKSP13*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP13*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
OAKSP17*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP17*	\$154.00	\$34.00	\$188.00	\$0.01
LECCSP14*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP14*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
OAKSP14*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP14*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
OAKSP15*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP15*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP11*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP11*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP12*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP12*	\$154.00	\$34.00	\$188.00	\$0.01
OAKSP9*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP9*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
OAKSP10*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP10*	\$150.00	\$34.00	\$184.00	\$0.01
OAKSP11*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP11*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
OAKSP12*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP12*	\$150.00	\$34.00	\$184.00	\$0.01
OAKSP16*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP16*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP8*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP8*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP9*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP9*	\$188.00	\$42.00	\$230.00	\$0.01
LECCSP10*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP10*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP13*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP13*	\$180.00	\$42.00	\$222.00	\$0.01
LECCSP5*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP5*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP6*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP6*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
LECCSP7*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP7*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
CENT1AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT1AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
CENT2AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT2AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
CENT3AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT3AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
CENT4AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT4AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI17AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI17AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI14AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI14AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI15AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI15AM*	\$180.00	\$34.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI16AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI16AM*	\$180.00	\$34.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI9AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI9AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI10AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI10AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI11AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI11AM*	\$180.00	\$34.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI12AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI12AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI13AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI13AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI1AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI1AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI2AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI2AM*	\$225.00	\$34.00	\$259.00	\$0.01
SCHI3AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI3AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI4AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI4AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI5AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI5AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI6AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI6AM*	\$180.00	\$34.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI7AM*	\$210.00	\$29.00	\$239.00	\$0.01	SCHI7AM*	\$	\$	\$0.00	\$0.01
SCHI8AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI8AM*	\$188.00	\$34.00	\$222.00	\$0.01

VENDOR:	HT BUS				VENDOR:	JAYS			
ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS AIDE	INC/DEC	ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS AIDE	INC/DEC
LHS1S*	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	LHS1S*	\$165.00	\$55.00	\$220.00	\$0.01
LMS1S*	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	LMS1S*	\$165.00	\$55.00	\$220.00	\$0.01
LMS2S*	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	LMS2S*	\$165.00	\$55.00	\$220.00	\$0.01
LMS3S*	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	LMS3S*	\$165.00	\$55.00	\$220.00	\$0.01
LHS2S*	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	LHS2S*	\$165.00	\$55.00	\$220.00	\$0.01
OAK8S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK8S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
LECC4S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC4S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
LECC1S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC1S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
LECC2S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC2S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
LECC3S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC3S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK5S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK5S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK6S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK6S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
HOMEOAK*	\$	\$		\$	HOMEOAK*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK7S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK7S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK1S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK1S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK2S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK2S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK3S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK3S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
OAK4S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK4S*	\$275.00	\$50.00	\$325.00	\$0.01
SCHI1P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI1P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI2P*	\$	\$	\$	\$	SCHI2P*	\$	\$	\$	\$
SCHI3P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI3P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI4P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI4P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT2P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT2P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT3P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT3P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT4P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT4P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI8P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI8P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI10P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI10P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI11P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI11P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT1P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT1P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI12P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI12P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI13P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI13P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI14P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI14P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI15P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI15P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI16P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI16P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI17P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI17P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI9P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI9P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI5P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI5P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI6P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI6P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI7P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI7P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT7P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT7P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT5P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT5P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT6P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT6P*	\$	\$		\$
LHSSP3*	\$	\$		\$	LHSSP3*	\$	\$		\$
LMSSP5*	\$	\$		\$	LMSSP5*	\$	\$		\$

LMSSP4*	\$160.00	\$60.00	\$220.00	\$0.01	LMSSP4*	\$	\$		\$
LHSSP4*	\$160.00	\$60.00	\$220.00	\$0.01	LHSSP4*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP13*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP13*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP17*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP17*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP14*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP14*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP14*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP14*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP15*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP15*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP11*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP11*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP12*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP12*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP9*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP9*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP10*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP10*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP11*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP11*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP12*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP12*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP16*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP16*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP8*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP8*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP9*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP9*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP10*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP10*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP13*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP13*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP5*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP5*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP6*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP6*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP7*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP7*	\$	\$		\$
CENT1AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT1AM*	\$	\$		\$
CENT2AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT2AM*	\$	\$		\$
CENT3AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT3AM*	\$	\$		\$
CENT4AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT4AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI17AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI17AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI14AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI14AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI15AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI15AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI16AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI16AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI9AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI9AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI10AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI10AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI11AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI11AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI12AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI12AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI13AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI13AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI1AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI1AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI2AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI2AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI3AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI3AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI4AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI4AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI5AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI5AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI6AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI6AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI7AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI7AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI8AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI8AM*	\$	\$		\$

ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS AIDE	INC/DEC C	ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS AIDE	INC/DEC
LHS1S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	LHS1S*	\$	\$		

LMS1S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	LMS1S*	\$	\$		\$
LMS2S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	LMS2S*	\$	\$		\$
LMS3S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	LMS3S*	\$	\$		\$
LHS2S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	LHS2S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK8S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK8S*	\$	\$		\$
LECC4S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC4S*	\$	\$		\$
LECC1S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC1S*	\$	\$		\$
LECC2S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC2S*	\$	\$		\$
LECC3S*	\$	\$		\$	LECC3S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK5S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	OAK5S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK6S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	OAK6S*	\$	\$		\$
HOMEOAK*	\$	\$		\$	HOMEOAK*	\$296.90	\$95.00	\$391.90	\$0.99
OAK7S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	OAK7S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK1S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK1S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK2S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	OAK2S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK3S*	\$	\$		\$	OAK3S*	\$	\$		\$
OAK4S*	\$168.00	\$59.00	\$227.00	\$0.01	OAK4S*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI1P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI1P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI2P*	\$	\$	\$	\$	SCHI2P*	\$	\$	\$	\$
SCHI3P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI3P*	\$169.90	\$50.00	\$219.90	\$0.99
SCHI4P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI4P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT2P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT2P*	\$163.90	\$50.00	\$213.90	\$0.99
CENT3P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT3P*	\$183.90	\$55.00	\$238.90	\$0.99
CENT4P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT4P*	\$183.90	\$55.00	\$238.90	\$0.99
SCHI8P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI8P*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
SCHI10P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI10P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI11P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI11P*	\$198.90	\$55.00	\$253.90	\$0.99
CENT1P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT1P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI12P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI12P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI13P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI13P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI14P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI14P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI15P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI15P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI16P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI16P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI17P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI17P*	\$153.90	\$50.00	\$203.90	\$0.99
SCHI9P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI9P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI5P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI5P*	\$158.90	\$50.00	\$208.90	\$0.99
SCHI6P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI6P*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI7P*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI7P*	\$178.90	\$55.00	\$233.90	\$0.99
CENT7P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT7P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT5P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT5P*	\$	\$		\$
CENT6P*	\$	\$		\$	CENT6P*	\$	\$		\$
LHSSP3*	\$	\$		\$	LHSSP3*	\$212.90	\$90.00	\$302.90	\$0.99
LMSSP5*	\$	\$		\$	LMSSP5*	\$	\$		\$
LMSSP4*	\$	\$		\$	LMSSP4*	\$212.90	\$90.00	\$302.90	\$0.99
LHSSP4*	\$	\$		\$	LHSSP4*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP13*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP13*	\$296.90	\$95.00	\$391.90	\$0.99
OAKSP17*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP17*	\$296.90	\$95.00	\$391.90	\$0.99
LECCSP14*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP14*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP14*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP14*	\$	\$		\$

OAKSP15*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP15*	\$296.90	\$95.00	\$391.90	\$0.99
LECCSP11*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP11*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP12*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP12*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP9*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP9*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP10*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP10*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP11*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP11*	\$	\$		\$
OAKSP12*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP12*		\$		\$
OAKSP16*	\$	\$		\$	OAKSP16*	\$296.90	\$95.00	\$391.90	\$0.99
LECCSP8*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP8*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP9*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP9*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP10*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP10*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP13*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP13*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP5*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP5*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP6*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP6*	\$	\$		\$
LECCSP7*	\$	\$		\$	LECCSP7*	\$	\$		\$
CENT1AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT1AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
CENT2AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT2AM*	\$	\$		\$
CENT3AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT3AM*	\$	\$		\$
CENT4AM*	\$	\$		\$	CENT4AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
SCHI17AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI17AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
SCHI14AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI14AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI15AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI15AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
SCHI16AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI16AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
SCHI9AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI9AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI10AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI10AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI11AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI11AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI12AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI12AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI13AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI13AM*		\$		\$
SCHI1AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI1AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI2AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI2AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI3AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI3AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99
SCHI4AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI4AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI5AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI5AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI6AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI6AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI7AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI7AM*	\$	\$		\$
SCHI8AM*	\$	\$		\$	SCHI8AM*	\$187.90	\$55.00	\$242.90	\$0.99

VENDOR:	SEMAN-TOV				VENDOR:	D.A.G.			
ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS	INC/DEC	ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE	RTE PLUS	INC/DEC
			AIDE					AIDE	
LHS1S*	\$227.00	\$40.00	\$267.00	\$0.01	LHS1S*				
LMS1S*	\$227.00	\$40.00	\$267.00	\$0.01	LMS1S*				
LMS2S*	\$227.00	\$40.00	\$267.00	\$0.01	LMS2S*				
LMS3S*	\$227.00	\$40.00	\$267.00	\$0.01	LMS3S*				
LHS2S*	\$227.00	\$40.00	\$267.00	\$0.01	LHS2S*				
OAK8S*	\$189.00	\$40.00	\$229.00	\$0.01	OAK8S*				

LECC4S*	\$330.00	\$40.00	\$370.00	\$0.01	LECC4S*				
LECC1S*	\$330.00	\$40.00	\$370.00	\$0.01	LECC1S*				
LECC2S*	\$330.00	\$40.00	\$370.00	\$0.01	LECC2S*				
LECC3S*	\$330.00	\$40.00	\$370.00	\$0.01	LECC3S*				
OAK5S*	\$279.00	\$40.00	\$319.00	\$0.01	OAK5S*				
OAK6S*	\$340.00	\$40.00	\$380.00	\$0.01	OAK6S*				
HOMEOAK*	\$228.00	\$40.00	\$268.00	\$0.01	HOMEOAK*				
OAK7S*	\$270.00	\$40.00	\$310.00	\$0.01	OAK7S*				
OAK1S*	\$270.00	\$40.00	\$310.00	\$0.01	OAK1S*				
OAK2S*	\$270.00	\$40.00	\$310.00	\$0.01	OAK2S*				
OAK3S*	\$330.00	\$40.00	\$370.00	\$0.01	OAK3S*				
OAK4S*	\$330.00	\$40.00	\$370.00	\$0.01	OAK4S*				
SCHI1P*	\$210.00	\$40.00	\$250.00	\$0.01	SCHI1P*				
SCHI2P*	\$210.00	\$40.00	\$250.00	\$0.01	SCHI2P*				
SCHI3P*	\$175.00	\$40.00	\$215.00	\$0.01	SCHI3P*				
SCHI4P*	\$210.00	\$40.00	\$250.00	\$0.01	SCHI4P*				
CENT2P*	\$200.00	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$0.01	CENT2P*	\$170.00	\$45.00	\$215.00	\$0.01
CENT3P*	\$200.00	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$0.01	CENT3P*	\$179.00	\$45.00	\$224.00	\$0.01
CENT4P*	\$200.00	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$0.01	CENT4P*	\$182.00	\$45.00	\$227.00	\$0.01
SCHI8P*	\$175.00	\$40.00	\$215.00	\$0.01	SCHI8P*				
SCHI10P*	\$175.00	\$40.00	\$215.00	\$0.01	SCHI10P*				
SCHI11P*	\$175.00	\$40.00	\$215.00	\$0.01	SCHI11P*			\$0.00	
CENT1P*	\$200.00	\$40.00	\$240.00	\$0.01	CENT1P*	\$185.00	\$45.00	\$230.00	\$0.01
SCHI12P*	\$190.00	\$40.00	\$230.00	\$0.01	SCHI12P*	\$165.00	\$45.00	\$210.00	\$0.01
SCHI13P*	\$190.00	\$40.00	\$230.00	\$0.01	SCHI13P*				
SCHI14P*	\$190.00	\$40.00	\$230.00	\$0.01	SCHI14P*	\$169.00	\$45.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI15P*	\$190.00	\$40.00	\$230.00	\$0.01	SCHI15P*				
SCHI16P*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI16P*				
SCHI17P*	\$160.00	\$40.00	\$200.00	\$0.01	SCHI17P*	\$197.00	\$45.00	\$242.00	\$0.01
SCHI9P*	\$160.00	\$40.00	\$200.00	\$0.01	SCHI9P*	\$191.00	\$45.00	\$236.00	\$0.01
SCHI5P*	\$160.00	\$40.00	\$200.00	\$0.01	SCHI5P*	\$163.00	\$45.00	\$208.00	\$0.01
SCHI6P*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI6P*				
SCHI7P*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI7P*	\$169.00	\$45.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
CENT7P*	\$150.00	\$40.00	\$190.00	\$0.01	CENT7P*	\$103.00	\$45.00	\$148.00	\$0.01
CENT5P*	\$150.00	\$40.00	\$190.00	\$0.01	CENT5P*	\$105.00	\$45.00	\$150.00	\$0.01
CENT6P*	\$150.00	\$40.00	\$190.00	\$0.01	CENT6P*	\$107.00	\$45.00	\$152.00	\$0.01
LHSSP3*	\$182.00	\$40.00	\$222.00	\$0.01	LHSSP3*	\$201.00	\$65.00	\$266.00	\$0.01
LMSSP5*	\$202.00	\$40.00	\$242.00	\$0.01	LMSSP5*				
LMSSP4*	\$202.00	\$40.00	\$242.00	\$0.01	LMSSP4*	\$179.00	\$65.00	\$244.00	\$0.01
LHSSP4*	\$182.00	\$40.00	\$222.00	\$0.01	LHSSP4*	\$185.00	\$65.00	\$250.00	\$0.01
OAKSP13*	\$222.00	\$40.00	\$262.00	\$0.01	OAKSP13*				
OAKSP17*	\$220.00	\$40.00	\$260.00	\$0.01	OAKSP17*	\$192.00	\$65.00	\$257.00	\$0.01
LECCSP14*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	LECCSP14*	\$188.00	\$65.00	\$253.00	\$0.01
OAKSP14*	\$222.00	\$40.00	\$262.00	\$0.01	OAKSP14*	\$200.00	\$65.00	\$265.00	\$0.01
OAKSP15*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	OAKSP15*				
LECCSP11*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	LECCSP11*				
LECCSP12*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	LECCSP12*	\$207.00	\$65.00	\$272.00	\$0.01
OAKSP9*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	OAKSP9*				
OAKSP10*	\$222.00	\$40.00	\$262.00	\$0.01	OAKSP10*	\$189.00	\$65.00	\$254.00	\$0.01

OAKSP11*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	OAKSP11*				
OAKSP12*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	OAKSP12*	\$187.00	\$65.00	\$252.00	\$0.01
OAKSP16*	\$248.00	\$40.00	\$288.00	\$0.01	OAKSP16*				
LECCSP8*	\$160.00	\$40.00	\$200.00	\$0.01	LECCSP8*	\$195.00	\$65.00	\$260.00	\$0.01
LECCSP9*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	LECCSP9*				
LECCSP10*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	LECCSP10*				
LECCSP13*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	LECCSP13*				
LECCSP5*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	LECCSP5*				
LECCSP6*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	LECCSP6*				
LECCSP7*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	LECCSP7*				
CENT1AM*	\$250.00	\$40.00	\$290.00	\$0.01	CENT1AM*	\$170.00	\$45.00	\$215.00	\$0.01
CENT2AM*	\$250.00	\$40.00	\$290.00	\$0.01	CENT2AM*				
CENT3AM*	\$250.00	\$40.00	\$290.00	\$0.01	CENT3AM*	\$179.00	\$45.00	\$224.00	\$0.01
CENT4AM*	\$250.00	\$40.00	\$290.00	\$0.01	CENT4AM*	\$165.00	\$45.00	\$210.00	\$0.01
SCHI17AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI17AM*	\$169.00	\$45.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI14AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI14AM*				
SCHI15AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI15AM*	\$189.00	\$45.00	\$234.00	\$0.01
SCHI16AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI16AM*				
SCHI9AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI9AM*				
SCHI10AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI10AM*	\$191.00	\$45.00	\$236.00	\$0.01
SCHI11AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI11AM*	\$169.00	\$45.00	\$214.00	\$0.01
SCHI12AM*	\$240.00	\$40.00	\$280.00	\$0.01	SCHI12AM*				
SCHI13AM*	\$180.00	\$40.00	\$220.00	\$0.01	SCHI13AM*				
SCHI1AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI1AM*	\$185.00	\$45.00	\$230.00	\$0.01
SCHI2AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI2AM*				
SCHI3AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI3AM*				
SCHI4AM*	\$180.00	\$40.00	\$220.00	\$0.01	SCHI4AM*	\$166.00	\$45.00	\$211.00	\$0.01
SCHI5AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI5AM*				
SCHI6AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI6AM*	\$197.00	\$45.00	\$242.00	\$0.01
SCHI7AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI7AM*				
SCHI8AM*	\$170.00	\$40.00	\$210.00	\$0.01	SCHI8AM*				

*HIGHLIGHTED AMOUNT INDICATES LOW BID

Awarded Routes will run from July 6, thru August 12, 2020; Monday through Thursday.

- S. Approve Holman, Frenia, Allison P.C. to perform an Overtime Wages, Fiscal and Operational Assessment at a cost not to exceed \$7,500.00 to be charged to account (11-000-230-332-00-0000).
- T. Move to Record and Award **Bid T17-2021** for Covid-19 Compliant Student Transportation Routes for Expiring Quotes received on January 26, 2021 @ 10:00 a.m. Two (2) responses were received and recorded as follows:
NOTE: The route numbers do not require the appended "Q" from the bid specifications as they are no longer quoted routes as a result of this bid.

**KLARR
TRANSPORT**

SEMAN-TOV

ROUTE NUMBER	ROUTE COST	AIDE COST	TTL DLY COST	X 82 DAYS	INC/DEC	ROUTE COST	AIDE COST	TTL DLY COST	X 82 DAYS	INC/DEC
LMSC29	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$144.00	\$30.00	\$174.00	\$14,268.00	\$0.01
LMSC30	\$210.00	\$40.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.00	\$144.00	\$30.00	\$174.00	\$14,268.00	\$0.01
LMSC31	NO BID					\$140.00	\$30.00	\$174.00	\$14,268.00	\$0.01
LMSC32	\$210.00	\$40.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.00	\$140.00	\$30.00	\$174.00	\$14,268.00	\$0.01
SC11	NO BID					\$136.00	\$30.00	\$166.00	\$13,612.00	\$0.01
OAKC16	NO BID					\$136.00	\$30.00	\$166.00	\$13,612.00	\$0.01
OAKC17	NO BID					\$136.00	\$30.00	\$166.00	\$13,612.00	\$0.01
HC29	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.01
HC30	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.01
HC31	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.01
HC32	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.01
HC33	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$500.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.01
HC34	\$115.00	\$44.00	\$159.00	\$13,038.00	\$0.00	\$200.00	\$50.00	\$250.00	\$20,500.00	\$0.01
CC7	NO BID					\$136.00	\$30.00	\$166.00	\$13,612.00	\$0.01
BC13	NO BID					\$136.00	\$30.00	\$166.00	\$13,612.00	\$0.01
		TOTAL BID		\$91,266.00			TOTAL BID		\$110,864.00	

Move to award Klarr Transport Services Inc. for a total amount of **\$91,266.00**; and

Move to award Seman-Tov for a total amount of **\$110,864.00** for Bid T17-2021 as their proposals were responsive and responsible.

U. Move to Record and Award **Bid 15-2021** for Nonpublic Schools Fencing received on 1/26/21 @ 11:00 a.m. Three (3) responses were received and recorded as follows:

PROMAX FENCE
SYSTEMS, INC
2624 CENTRE AVE

ABHZEEN DESIGN
340SCHOOL ROAD EAST

NONO'S FENCING II, INC.
17 ROSE PARK CRESCENT

SCHOOLCOSTSCHOOLCOSTSCHOOLCOST

1. Talmud Torah Yesodei Hatorah	\$10,351.00	1. Talmud Torah Yesodei Hatorah	\$9,976.00	1. Talmud Torah Yesodei Hatorah	\$6,300.00
2. Yeshiva Nesivos Hatorah	\$7,225.00	2. Yeshiva Nesivos Hatorah	\$7,045.00	2. Yeshiva Nesivos Hatorah	\$5,300.00
3. Yeshiva Ohr Hatorah	\$18,470.00	3. Yeshiva Ohr Hatorah	\$25,640.00	3. Yeshiva Ohr Hatorah	\$15,050.00
4. Yeshiva Yagdil Torah	\$10,300.00	4. Yeshiva Yagdil Torah	\$9,875.00	4. Yeshiva Yagdil Torah	\$7,500.00
5. Bnos Devorah	\$12,805.00	5. Bnos Devorah	\$14,775.00	5. Bnos Devorah	\$10,100.00
6. Bnos Bracha	\$18,125.00	6. Bnos Bracha	\$18,000.00	6. Bnos Bracha	\$10,800.00
7. Yeshiva Kol Torah	\$8,250.00	7. Yeshiva Kol Torah	\$8,950.00	7. Yeshiva Kol Torah	\$6,300.00
8. Talmud Torah of Lakewood	\$12,520.00	8. Talmud Torah of Lakewood	\$13,799.00	8. Talmud Torah of Lakewood	\$11,800.00

Move to award Nojo's Fencing II, Inc. for **Bid 15-2021** for Nonpublic Schools Fencing for a total not to exceed **\$73,150.00** as they were the low bidder and their proposal was responsive and responsible.

XI. REPORTS AND RECOMMENDATIONS OF SUPERINTENDENT:

A. Superintendent Items

13. Approval for the following Nonpublic grant playground items (addition to Item 13 on original 1/27/21).

School	Vendor	Description	Amount	Grant	Account
Cheder Bnei Torah	BSN Sports	Basketball Hoops	\$ 9934.97	Title IV	20-280-200-600-30-0961-82I

27. Approve the following Books to be used in the public schools:

Author	Title	ISBN #	Publisher	Copyright (year)	Edition
Mrs. D. Zelcer	Alphabet 1	9781732924802	NSLD	2018	1
Mrs. D. Zelcer	Alphabet 2	9781732924819	NSLD	2018	1
Mrs. D. Zelcer	Vowels 2	9781732924833	NSLD	2018	1
Mrs. D. Zelcer	Vowels 3	9781732924840	NSLD	2018	1
Mrs. D. Zelcer	Schwa	9781732924857	NSLD	2018	1
Mashy Frankl and Gitty Brodt	Phonemic Foundations Workbook	9781949337020	Reading Foundations LLC	2019	Classic
Mrs. Rivka Tress and Mrs. Rivky Grossman	Ready To Read	9780999736975	NextLevel Literacy	2018	1
Mrs. Rivka Tress and Mrs. Rivky Grossman	Ready To Step Read-Grade 2 Phonics Review and Syllabication	9780999736982	NextLevel Literacy	2018	2
Mrs. Rivka Tress and Mrs. Rivky Grossman	Ready To Step Up-Grade 3 Syllabication Review	9780999736999	NextLevel Literacy	2018	1
Spots	Spots Math First Grade	9780985112981	Spots	2020	1
Catherine LeTourneau, Alfred Posamentier	Progress in Mathematics, k-8	9780821536025	William H. Sadlier, inc	2014	N/A
School Specialty	Worldly Wise3000 Book 7	9780838876060	School Specialty	2007	7

Dr. Allen Bellman, Catherine Tourneau, and Dr. Jull Perry	Sadlier Math Student Edition, Kindergarten Level. Volume 1	9781421789804	William H. Sadlier, Inc.	2019	Sadlier Math
Sara Gross	Book 1 Readers for Kid in the Middle, Digraphs and Blends	9781940205427	Read Bright	2017	1
Sara Gross	Book 2- Magic E and Walking Talking Vowels	9781940205656	Read Bright	2015	1
Sara Gross	ABC Blending Book out of order	9781947737044	Read Bright	2018	1
Modern Curriculum Press	Phonics Level B	0765200120	Modern Curriculum Press	1998	N/A
Scott Foresman	Seeing Is Believing	0328018198	Scott Foresman	2002	N/A
Dr. Carole Greenes	Houghton Mifflin Mathematics	0618099786	Houghton Mifflin	2002	2
Ruth Brooks	Writing Practice Book #4	9780990001317	Leren Curriculum	2015	1
Ruth Brooks	Writing Practice Book #5	9781941856444	Leren Curriculum	2017	1
Ruth Brooks	Writing Practice Book #6	9781941856475	Leren Curriculum	2017	1
Prentice Hall	MIDDLE GRADE MATH COMMON CORE COURSE 3	9780133196696	Prentice Hall	2011	N/A
Mrs. Draizy Zelcer	Hebrew Reading Curriculum	9781732924802	NSLD	2018	1
Mrs. draizy Zelcer	Hebrew Reading Curriculum	9781732924819	Mrs. Draizy Zelcer	2018	2
Mrs. draizy Zelcer	vowels 9	9781732924857	Mrs. draizy Zelcer	2018	6
Dr. Carol Greenes	Houghton Mifflin Mathematics	9780618099771	Houghton Mifflin Company	2002	2
Rivka Stern	Current Events Book	9781735366104	Ardent Education	2020	N/A

C. L. Gorelick	Penmanship Phonics	9780988865853	C.L. Gorelick	2013	2
Jerome Shostak	Vocabulary Workshop Level D	0821571095	Sadlier	2005	N/A
Dr. Carol Greenes	Houghton Mifflin Mathematics 4	0618099786	Houghton Mifflin	2002	2
Vivian Bernstein	Americas Story	073982385x	Steck Vaughn	2001	1
Fred Gipson	Old Yeller	9780060935474	Harper and Row	2009	Classic
Resnick	Fundamentals of Writing level 1	9781948241113	Achievements	2020	1
Schwartz	A History of America volume 1	9781948241090	Achievements	2020	1
Schwartz	A History of America volume 2	9781948241168	Achievements	2020	1
Grant	The Building Blocks of Engineering workbook	9781726089319	STEM Advancement	2016	1
Grant	The Building Blocks of Engineering textbook	9781726090766	STEM Advancement	2016	1
NA	The World Around Us	9780972265508	Palmtree Publishing	2002	1
Houghten Mifflin	Houghton Mifflin Grade 5 Textbook	9781951125165	BP Print Group	2020	5
Rucker/Dilley/Lo wry	Heath Mathematics Level 5	9780669104776	Houghton Mifflin	2020	N/A
Rucker/Dilley/Lo wry	Heath Mathematics Level 6	9780669104783	Houghton Mifflin	2020	N/A
Rucker/Dilley/Lo wry	Heath Mathematics Level 7	9780669104790	Houghton Mifflin	2020	N/A
Rose Taylor	Fly with Derby Handwriting	9781941856406	Leren Curriculum	2016	1
Leren Curriculum	Writing Practice 4	9781941856048	Leren Curriculum	2015	1
Michael Morpurgo	Waiting for Anya	9780140384314	Penguin	1990	1

Savvas Learning Co	MIDDLE GRADES MATH 2010 ALL-IN-ONE STUDENT WORKBOOK COURSE 3 VERSION A	9780133721478	Savvas Learning Co	2010	N/A
Joy Littell	Building English Skills	0-86609-079-7	McDougal Littell	1990	N/A
Joy Littell	Building English Skills	0-86609-087-8	McDougal Littell	1990	N/A
Joy Littell	Building English Skills	9780812357349	McDougal Littell	1990	N/A
Wilson Rawls	Where the Red Fern Grows	9780440412670	Yearling	1996	Classic
Arscroll	Implications of Literature, Explorer Level	9781930592001	Textword Press	2000	1
Arscroll Mesorah	Implications of Literature, Pioneer Level	9781930592049	Arscroll Mesorah	2001	1
Arscroll Mesorah	Implications of Literature, Navigator Level	9781930592025	Textword Press	2002	1
Arscroll Mesorah	Implications of Literature, Trailblazer Level	9781930592063	Textword Press	2005	1
Shevy Friedman	WordArts C	9781532369001	Roth Publishers	2019	1
Shevy Friedman	WordArts B	9781532368967	Roth Publishers Inc	2018	2
CHAYA S.CWEIBER	The iCount Method™ Level Red Math Book, Volume 1, Expanded Edition	9781948736138	ICOUNT METHOD	2018	1
Leah H. Aaron	Anthology of American Literature	9781941856628	Leren Curriculum Inc	2020	1
CHAYA S. CWEIBER	The iCount Method™ Level Red Math Homework Book	9781948736039	ICOUNT METHOD	2018	1

CHAYA S. CWEIBER	The iCount Method® Level Green Math Book, Classic Edition	9781948736732	ICOUNT METHOD	2019	1
CHAYA S. CWEIBER	The iCount Method® Level Green Homework and Extra Practice Book, Classic Edition	9781948736749	ICOUNT METHOD	2019	1
Faigy Rosenberg and Esti Weiss	Take me home step by step reading series	9781736242803	A Step Above	2020	1
scott foresman	New Beginings	0673596419	scott foresman	2000	2
L Beck	Soaring High	9781929908042	Ohr Halimud	2015	3
scott foresman	Lets learn together	0673596389	scott foresman	2000	1
Nisan Erps	Learn and Explore Workbook	9781941856383	Leren Curriculum	2018	1
Rose Taylor	Handwriting Hour Grade 2	9781941856192	Derby Curriculum	2016	1
L Beck	Looking Ahead	9781929908462	Ohr Halimud	2016	1
zaner bloser	Spelling Connections	9780736768603	Zaner Bloser	2012	6
zaner bloser	spelling connections	9780736768580	zaner bloser	2012	4
zaner bloser	spelling connections	9780736768573	zaner bloser	2012	3
Catherine LeTourneau, Alfred Posamentier	Progress in Mathematics K-8	9780821536025	William H. Sadlier Inc	2017	N/A
Catherine LeTourneau, Alfred Posamentier	Progress in Mathematics, K-8	9780821551042	William H Sadlier Inc	2017	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812353862	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812353889	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812353900	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A

Dolores Boylston Bohlen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812353927	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohlen	McDougal Littell Spelling	081253862	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohlen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812353889	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohlen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812353900	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohlen	McDougal Littell Spelling	08142353927	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Dolores Boylston Bohlen	McDougal Littell Spelling	0812385810	Houghton Mifflin	1990	N/A
Nechemia Weiss	Kindergarten Student Book	9780989316828	Spots Educational Resources	2016	4
GILBERTSON/LEHMAN	UNIQUE GLOBALIMPORTS	9780538447393	CENGAGE LEARNING	2009	BA201E2
WILLIAM A MCCLENAGHAN	AMERICAN GOVERNMENT	9780133240825	PEARSON	2013	Classic
Yaakov Lubin	Fundamentals of Life Science Workbook and Lab Manual	9781733053105	The Jewish Center for Science	2019	1
Peter Roop	Buttons for General Washington	9780876144763	Lerner Publisher	1990	1
M. Wetterer	Kate Shelly and the Midnight Express	9780876145418	Lerner Publisher	1990	1
Jeff Brown	Stanley Flat Again	9780064421737	Harper Collins	2009	2
David A. Adler	Young Can Jansen and the millionaire Mystery	9780142404171	Penguin Random House	2012	1
David A. Adler	Young Can Janson and the Snowy Day Mystery	9780142404171	Penguin Random House	2004	Classic
Pat Catling	Chocolate Touch	9780688161330	Harper Collins	2006	Classic
John Gardiner	Stone Fox	9780064401326	Harper Collins	2003	Classic

Rucker/Dilley/Lo wry	Heath Mathematics	0669104779	Houghton Mifflin	2020	N/A
Rucker/Dilley/Lo wry	Heath Mathematics	0669104787	Houghton Mifflin	2020	N/A
Rucker/Dilley/Lo wry	Heath Mathematics	0669104795	Houghton Mifflin	2020	N/A
Esther Schwatz	American History	9781948241090	Achievements	2020	1
sury ausch	mastering quickbooks pro	9780991458554	ed courses inc,	2014	Classic
Resnick	Hands-On Science level 1	9781948241021	Achievements	2019	1
Resnick	Hands-On Science level 2	9781948241038	Achievements	2019	1
Mashy Frankl	Phonemic Foundations Workbook	9781949337020	Roth	2019	1
Jerome Shostak	Vocabulary Workshop Achieve	9781421785080	Sadlier	2017	N/A
Jerome Shoshtak	Vocabulary Workshop Achieve	9781421785073	Sadlier	2017	N/A
Jerome Shostak	Vocabulary Workshop Achieve Levvel A	9781421785066	Sadlier	2017	N/A
Zaner Bloser	Spelling Connections	9780736768566	Zaner Bloser	2012	student
P. Neuberger	On Time Let's Review	9781614654599	Math Tracks, LLC	2020	1
P. Neuberger	On Time Homework	9781614654612	Math Tracks, LLC	2020	1
Fred Gipson	Old Yeller	9780060935474	Harper and Row Publishers	2009	Classic
Microsoft	Office Pro Plus 2019	79P05717	Microsoft	2019	N/A
Yocheved Broyde	Bonding with the Reference Tables	9781637322567	Imprint Primedia E Launch LLC	2020	1
Jerome Shoshtak	Vocabulary Workshop Achieve	9781421716435	Sadlier	2017	N/A

(Update from the December 16, 2020 addendum).

33. Approve Elsa Mena to present "Making Sight Words Seriously Fun" on Tuesday, May 25, 2021 at the NJTESOL Conference. The registration fee of \$199.00 to be paid through Title III, budget account #20-241-200-500-15-0015.
34. Approve to restore the salary increment for employee #5448 which will be retroactive for the time period from July 1, 2020 through the current pay period.
35. Approve to revise Policy/Regulation 8220. The words "School Office Personnel" shall be removed from Section (B) (2). The words "School Office Personnel" shall be removed from Section (c) (2).
36. Approve Perel Kuritsky, LLC to provide speech therapy services at \$65.00 per hour and \$220.00 per evaluation for the 2020-2021 school year, not to exceed \$40,000, to be paid through budget account #11-000-216-320-00-0000.
37. Approve Rich Ogle, Bryan Powell, Julian Cucco, Ryan Corrigan, Michael Pellitteri, Kevin Cooper, overtime, on an as needed basis, to complete the configuration and deployment of the new fleet of Chromebooks from January 15, 2021 through June 30, 2021, to be paid through budget account #11.000.252.100.00.0000.
38. Approve Michael Pellitteri, district video productions, athletic, and other live-stream events, at a rate of \$40.00/hr. from January 20, 2021-June 30, 2021 to be paid through budget account #11.000.230.100.02.0002.
39. Approve Laura A. Winters, Course EDUC, 8090 Doctoral Study Intensive, Walden University, January 11, 2021 - April 11, 2021, at a Semester Cost of \$5,900.00.

B. Personnel

1. CERTIFICATED

a. Resignations

1. COSTELLO, Barbara
Bilingual Teacher- CAGS
Effective: March 27, 2021

b. Retirements

1. JANKOSKI, Kathleen
Speech/Language Therapist- LMS
Effective: March 1, 2021 or sooner
(Updated from 1/6/2021 Agenda)

2. NON-CERTIFICATED

a. Resignations

1. FISCHER, Stephanie
Paraprofessional- LECC
Effective: February 11, 2021
2. AUSTIN, Kenneth
Security Specialist- CAGS
Effective: January 26, 2021

c. Terminations

1. Employee #7398
Job Abandonment
Effective: January 4, 2021

f. Appointments

3. *HART, Darrius
Paraprofessional- 1:1- Piner
Effective: February 1, 2021
Terminating: June 30, 2021
Salary: Step 9, 90 Credits- \$21,124.00 prorated
(New Position)
(Budget Account #11.000.217.106.10.0010)
4. *FRANCIS, DaShawn
Paraprofessional- 1:1- EGCS
Effective: February 1, 2021
Terminating: June 30, 2021
Salary: Step 14, 0 Credits- \$21,099.00 prorated
(Replacement for S. Esposito- Resigned)
(Budget Account #11.000.217.106.05.0005)

i. Salary Adjustments

1. Security Specialist

Effective: January 28, 2021
Terminating: June 30, 2021
Salary: \$30.00 per hour as per Contract
for Paraprofessional ParaPro Passing Grade or NJDOE
Teacher Substitute Certificate

Name
Robert Scudieri- Paraprofessional
Athaanasios Mikros- Paraprofessional

R 8220 SCHOOL CLOSINGS

The following procedures will govern the unscheduled closing of school for the entire school day, the delayed opening of school, and the early closing of school. No single set of rules can anticipate the problems that may be encountered when schools must be closed, and Building Principals may be required to exercise independent judgment in individual circumstances. Any consequent deviation from these rules shall be approved by the Superintendent.

A. Notification Provisions

1. The Superintendent or designee shall activate an emergency call system when a decision is made for an unscheduled closing of school for the entire school day, the delayed opening of school, or the early closing of school.
2. Parent(s) will be notified at the beginning of each school year that they will be notified of an emergency school closing day by means of announcements through the district Alert System, District Website: <https://www.lakewoodpiners.org>

B. All Day Closing

1. The decision to close schools for the day will be made in accordance with Policy. As soon as the decision is made, the Superintendent or designee will promptly notify:
 - a. The media outlets identified in A.1. above;
 - b. All school staff members;
 - c. Private schools to which transportation is provided for district children;
 - d. Lakewood Police Departments;
 - e. Board of Education President; and

f. Any other individuals or organizations the Superintendent or designee determines the need to be notified.

2. Notwithstanding a provision in a collective bargaining agreement, if applicable, unless the Superintendent determines otherwise, custodial personnel are expected to report for work on an emergency closed day.

C. Delayed Opening

1. The decision to delay the opening of school will be made as soon as practicable. Notice of the delayed opening will be given in accordance with B. above.

2. Notwithstanding a provision in a collective bargaining agreement, unless the Superintendent determines otherwise, custodial personnel are expected to report to work on time if the opening of school is delayed.

3. If weather conditions change after a delayed opening has been announced, the Superintendent may decide to close schools for the day. This decision will be made as soon as practicable. Notice of the closing of schools for the day will be given in accordance with B.1. above.

4. The Principal of each school will modify the school's schedule to accommodate the shorter day. After-school and athletic events may be canceled.

D. Early Dismissal

1. The decision by the Superintendent or designee to close school early will be promptly relayed to the media outlets, school staff members, and the people or organizations listed in B.1. above.

2. Building Principals in the affected schools will promptly notify all school staff members of the early closing, using appropriate building procedures.

3. Parents will be notified of an early dismissal through an emergency call system, district or school website, a telephone communication chain, or any other method or process deemed appropriate.
4. A parent may come to the school and sign out his/her child at any time after the decision to close early has been made. Any removal of a child must be in strict accordance with Policy and Regulation 5230 regarding the person(s) to whom a child may be released.
5. The Principal may designate a safe and secure location in the school building to which may be assigned students whose parent or temporary caretaker could not be reached by telephone or other means or the student was unable to be released from school early for good reason.
 - a. A teaching staff member will be assigned to supervise the students who remain in the school.

Issued: 17 October 2013

Revised: 22 April 2020